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and denied access to counsel tabled in the House of 
Commons; report found the procedures followed in 
most cases were beyond reproach. Apr. 6, An­
nouncement of Canadian Government program to 
equip and train an air force in the African Common­
wealth country of Tanzania. Leonard S. Mar-
chand, a member of the Okanagan Indian Band, 
appointed Special Assistant to Minister of Citizen­
ship and Immigration, the first Indian to be 
appointed to the personal staff of a Federal Cabinet 
Minister. Apr. 7, Hon. L£on Baleer, M.P. for 
Trois-Rivi&res, left the Progressive Conservative 
Party to sit in the House of Commons as an 
Independent. Apr. 8, Announcement of Canada's 
financial participation in the $1,000,000,000 aid 
plan for Southeast Asia proposed by U.S. President 
Johnson. Tributes expressed in the House of 
Commons in recognition of the 100th anniversary 
of the founding of the Salvation Army; special 
service of commemoration held in Christ Church 
Cathedral, Ottawa. Apr. 9, Gift of $20,000 by the 
Federal Government to the Canadian Red Cross, in 
addition to the $5,000 provided by the CRC from 
its own funds, for aid in Chile following an earth­
quake. Apr. 10, Formal opening of $1,000,000 air 
terminal at London, Ont. Collision between Dutch 
ship Hermes and the German ship Transatlantic in 
the St. Lawrence River near Trois-Rivi&res resulted 
in the death of three seamen and the sinking of 
the latter ship. Apr. 18, Albert Williamson, a public 
relations man, committed for trial on charges of 
forging the signature of Premier W. A. C. Bennett 
on a letter to the special assistant to Prime Minister 
Pearson, supporting the application of Harry 
Stonehill for landed immigrant status in Canada 
subsequent to his rejection by the Department of 
Citizenship and Immigration: sentenced June 4 to 
two six-month concurrent jail terms and fined $1,000. 
Allotment of $3,300,000 for a nation-wide festival 
of the performing arts in Canada's centennial year 
announced by the Federal Government. Apr. 17, 
CPR passenger train, carrying 375 passengers, de­
railed near Terrace Bay, Ont; one person killed and 
47 injured. Apr. £1, Gregory Clark, veteran 
Toronto newspaper man, named first honorary 
member of a newly instituted News Hall of Fame. 
Apr. 23, Following the claim of Quebec Education 
Minister Gerin-Lajoie that the Quebec Government 
has the right to conclude "agreements" with 
foreign governments about matters coming under 
its field of jurisdiction, External Affairs Minister 
Martin declared that independent "treaty-making 
powers" are the prerogative of sovereign states. 
Apr. 26, The Federal Budget announced by Finance 
Minister Gordon included benefits for business and 
a 10-p.c. cut in personal income tax. Apr. 28, 
1,200 representatives of the Ontario Farmers' Union 
marched on Parliament Hill and presented a 
petition to the Federal Cabinet requesting higher 
farm support prices. Death of John Adams in 
Brantford, one of the founders of the Royal 
Canadian Legion and first President of the Legion's 
Branch No. 1 in Toronto. Apr. 29, The Stephen 
Leacock Memorial Medal for Humor presented to 
veteran newspaper man Gregory Clark. Apr. 80, 
The Vanier Institute of the Family received 
charter; Dr. Wilder Penfield of Montreal elected 
President. 

May: Construction started on the $500,000,000 
Columbia River power project officially. The 
Canadian National Exhibition, Toronto, to es­
tablish an Indian Hall of Fame, beginning with a 
portrait gallery honouring 12 famous Canadian 
Indians. The first of across-Canada network of 
emergency telephone centres protected from nuclear 
bomb radiation established at Red Deer, Alta. 
May 1, Trinity College School, Port Hope, Ont., 
celebrated its 100th anniversary. The Montreal 
Canadiens won the Stanley Cup, symbol of pro­
fessional hockey supremacy. May 2, Georges 
Lemay, one of Canada's most wanted criminals, 
arrested in Fort Lauderdale, Fla., following broad­

cast of his picture as part of the Canadian contribu­
tion to the inauguration of the international tele­
vision facilities of the Early Bird satellite. May 4, 
Appointment of a Special Committee on Corrections 
announced by Justice Minister Favreau; Mr. 
Justice Roger Ouimet of Montreal, chairman. 
May 6, Senator Norman Paterson installed as first 
Chancellor of Lakehead College of Arts, Science 
and Technology, Port Arthur, Ont., to reopen in 
September as Lakehead University. May 7, 
Toronto's three daily newspapers and 225 members 
of the Toronto Mailers Union reached agreement 
for a return to work after a mailers' strike which 
began July 9, 1964. Two Soviet diplomats ex­
pelled from Canada following discovery of an 
alleged plot to establish an extensive espionage 
network in Canada; one of the two civil servants 
involved dismissed without right of appeal Dec. 31. 
May 8, Death of Vice-Admiral H. T. W. Grant, 
former Chief of Naval Staff. May 10, Cornerstone 
of the National Library and Archives Building, 
Ottawa, laid by Governor General Vanier. May 
11, Seven members of the 12-man team of the 2nd 
Battalion, the Royal Canadian Regiment, won 
Duke of Edinburgh trophy for marksmanship and 
physical fitness for third consecutive year; received 
the award from Prince Philip at Buckingham 
Palace. May 11-13, NATO ministerial meeting 
held in London, England. May 12, In a ruling on 
charges against non-reserve Indians of failing to pay 
compulsory premiums for Saskatchewan hospital 
and medical care, the terms of a Treaty made in 
1876 between Queen Victoria and certain Saskat­
chewan Indian tribes requiring the Federal Govern­
ment to provide free hospital and medical care for 
all Indians in the province, were upheld. May 19, 
Federal program outlined to assist persons moving 
from one community to another for employment; 
revolving loan fund of $5,000,000 and an additional 
$5,000,000 annually in grants to be provided. 
Arrival in Ottawa of Their Imperial Majesties the 
Shah of Iran and Empress Farah beginning an 
eight-day state visit to Canada. May 20, Holland 
became the first country to make a formal contract 
for participation in Expo 67. Admiral of the Fleet 
Earl Mountbatten of Burma visited Prime 
Minister Pearson in Ottawa as head of a British 
mission of inquiry into Commonwealth immigration 
problems. May 21, The flag of Ontario—the Red 
Ensign bearing the Ontario Coat of Arms—pro­
claimed. Hon. George A. Drew, former High 
Commissioner for Canada to Britain, installed as 
Chancellor of the University of Guelph at its first 
convocation. May 24, One of seven Scarves of 
Honour crocheted by Queen Victoria in 1900 for 
presentation to Boer War heroes, won 65 years ago 
by Pte. Richard Rowland Thompson of Ottawa, 
presented by his nephew, S. F. Thompson of Cork, 
Ireland, to Governor General Vanier in ceremony 
on Parliament Hill; it is on permanent display in 
the Canadian War Museum. Demonstrations by 
Quebec separatists in Montreal marked the Victoria 
Day holiday, resulting in about 25 arrests; three 
monuments in Quebec City defaced in other demon­
strations. May 27, Plans announced for a 
$10,000,000 provincial park along the north shore 
of the Ottawa river between Carillon and Hull—a 
joint federal-provincial centennial project. May 
28, Four Canadians in first unescorted transatlantic 
flight of a helicopter from Stratford, Conn., U.S.A. 
to Prestwick, Scotland. May 81, Death of Hon. 
George Nowlan, M.P. for Digby-Annapolis-Kings 
since 1950, and former Minister of National 
Revenue and Minister of Finance. 

June: June 1, Document on "Principles of Union" 
made public by the Anglican and United Churches 
of Canada; to be studied by committees of each 
denomination. The world's first icebreaking cable-
repair ship built for the Canadian Coast Guard 
christened CCGS John Cabot at Montreal. June 2, 
Legislation providing for the retirement of Senators 
at age 75 received assent. June S-6, U.S. astronauts 


